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By day, these agents are cowboys; by night they are specialized government operatives. Men bound by
love, loyalty and the law—they've vowed to keep their missions and identities confidential….

THE MISSION: BODYGUARD—FOR A VIRGIN?

Tough, wary Frank Connolly promised to deliver scientist C.J. Birch to a secret research facility, safe and
sound. But when the stuffy intellectual Frank expected turned out to be one Cecilia Jane, innocent beauty,
Frank smelled trouble. Only his highly tuned skills kept them alive when a kidnap attempt left them stranded,
alone in the mountain wilderness.With a mercenary on their trail, Frank's mission was twofold: protect C.J.
from those who would use her knowledge for evil and resist the awakening desire in the naive virgin's eyes.
Because Frank knew too well how deadly personal involvement could be—and his feelings for C.J. were
definitely personal…
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From reader reviews:

Carmen Jensen:

Now a day people who Living in the era where everything reachable by interact with the internet and the
resources in it can be true or not call for people to be aware of each facts they get. How people have to be
smart in having any information nowadays? Of course the reply is reading a book. Reading through a book
can help individuals out of this uncertainty Information particularly this Someone To Protect Her book
because this book offers you rich details and knowledge. Of course the information in this book hundred pct
guarantees there is no doubt in it as you know.

Patrick Walker:

Does one one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt when you find yourself in the book store?
Make an effort to pick one book that you find out the inside because don't assess book by its handle may
doesn't work the following is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not because
fantastic as in the outside appear likes. Maybe you answer could be Someone To Protect Her why because
the amazing cover that make you consider about the content will not disappoint you. The inside or content
will be fantastic as the outside or perhaps cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly make suggestions to
pick up this book.

Suzanne Crider:

In this time globalization it is important to someone to receive information. The information will make
someone to understand the condition of the world. The healthiness of the world makes the information much
easier to share. You can find a lot of recommendations to get information example: internet, newspaper,
book, and soon. You can observe that now, a lot of publisher that print many kinds of book. Often the book
that recommended to you is Someone To Protect Her this reserve consist a lot of the information of the
condition of this world now. This specific book was represented how do the world has grown up. The words
styles that writer require to explain it is easy to understand. The writer made some research when he makes
this book. That's why this book appropriate all of you.

Edmund Hillman:

A lot of reserve has printed but it is unique. You can get it by world wide web on social media. You can
choose the very best book for you, science, comedy, novel, or whatever by means of searching from it. It is
called of book Someone To Protect Her. You can add your knowledge by it. Without making the printed
book, it might add your knowledge and make a person happier to read. It is most important that, you must
aware about guide. It can bring you from one destination to other place.
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