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Learn to go beyond your average speed reading skills—with SuperReading™

A practical guide to boosting speed, comprehension, and powers of recall!

Packed with tools and techniques from the author's years of experience, this book can help readers overcome
poor reading habits and learn to read at high speeds with good comprehension and recall. It includes memory
training; information on learning, attitude, and achievement; and unique exercises that teach readers to
mentally process multiple words at a glance.

Some of Ron Cole's unique methods for improving your reading skills include:

• Hand Pacing: Using your hand (i.e. tracking the words you're reading with your finger) and adjusting the
angle at which you sit to improve your focus.

• Previewing: Reading the first sentence of every paragraph of a document in order to give yourself a head
start on the entirety of the material.

• Eye-Hop™: A unique method to the SuperReading technique that will teach the reader to read and
comprehend groups of words at a time, rather than individually.

• Parroting: A method for repeating to yourself—either aloud or on paper—information you have just read,
making the material a multisensory experience and further cementing the knowledge in your mind.

• Reviewing: Methods for quickly going back over material so that you'll never have to read it again!

The results can save readers hours every week—a must for students who need to learn mounds of
information, business professionals who have to deal with a sea of e-mails, or for anyone who wants to
improve their reading skills!
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From reader reviews:

Samara Reed:

This book untitled SuperReading for Success: The Groundbreaking, Brain-Based Program to Improve Your
Speed, Enhance Your Memo ry, and Increase Your Success (Tarcher Master Mind Editions) to be one of
several books in which best seller in this year, that is because when you read this book you can get a lot of
benefit on it. You will easily to buy that book in the book retail outlet or you can order it via online. The
publisher in this book sells the e-book too. It makes you more easily to read this book, since you can read
this book in your Cell phone. So there is no reason to your account to past this e-book from your list.

Marvin Smith:

Reading a e-book can be one of a lot of exercise that everyone in the world adores. Do you like reading book
consequently. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoy it. First reading a e-book will give you a lot of
new details. When you read a e-book you will get new information mainly because book is one of many
ways to share the information as well as their idea. Second, examining a book will make anyone more
imaginative. When you reading a book especially hype book the author will bring one to imagine the story
how the personas do it anything. Third, you could share your knowledge to others. When you read this
SuperReading for Success: The Groundbreaking, Brain-Based Program to Improve Your Speed, Enhance
Your Memo ry, and Increase Your Success (Tarcher Master Mind Editions), you could tells your family,
friends along with soon about yours guide. Your knowledge can inspire the others, make them reading a
publication.

Margaret Honig:

As a student exactly feel bored in order to reading. If their teacher inquired them to go to the library as well
as to make summary for some book, they are complained. Just minor students that has reading's spirit or real
their interest. They just do what the teacher want, like asked to go to the library. They go to presently there
but nothing reading critically. Any students feel that looking at is not important, boring as well as can't see
colorful pics on there. Yeah, it is for being complicated. Book is very important for you personally. As we
know that on this period of time, many ways to get whatever we wish. Likewise word says, ways to reach
Chinese's country. Therefore this SuperReading for Success: The Groundbreaking, Brain-Based Program to
Improve Your Speed, Enhance Your Memo ry, and Increase Your Success (Tarcher Master Mind Editions)
can make you feel more interested to read.

Robert Hightower:

Reading a publication make you to get more knowledge as a result. You can take knowledge and information
originating from a book. Book is composed or printed or descriptive from each source in which filled update
of news. Within this modern era like at this point, many ways to get information are available for you. From



media social like newspaper, magazines, science e-book, encyclopedia, reference book, novel and comic.
You can add your knowledge by that book. Isn't it time to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just
trying to find the SuperReading for Success: The Groundbreaking, Brain-Based Program to Improve Your
Speed, Enhance Your Memo ry, and Increase Your Success (Tarcher Master Mind Editions) when you
needed it?
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