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Hidden away in foggy, uncharted rain forest valleys in Northern California are the largest and tallest
organisms the world has ever sustained–the coast redwood trees, Sequoia sempervirens. Ninety-six percent
of the ancient redwood forests have been destroyed by logging, but the untouched fragments that remain are
among the great wonders of nature. The biggest redwoods have trunks up to thirty feet wide and can rise
more than thirty-five stories above the ground, forming cathedral-like structures in the air. Until recently,
redwoods were thought to be virtually impossible to ascend, and the canopy at the tops of these majestic
trees was undiscovered. In The Wild Trees, Richard Preston unfolds the spellbinding story of Steve Sillett,
Marie Antoine, and the tiny group of daring botanists and amateur naturalists that found a lost world above
California, a world that is dangerous, hauntingly beautiful, and unexplored.

The canopy voyagers are young–just college students when they start their quest–and they share a passion
for these trees, persevering in spite of sometimes crushing personal obstacles and failings. They take big
risks, they ignore common wisdom (such as the notion that there’s nothing left to discover in North
America), and they even make love in hammocks stretched between branches three hundred feet in the air.

The deep redwood canopy is a vertical Eden filled with mosses, lichens, spotted salamanders, hanging
gardens of ferns, and thickets of huckleberry bushes, all growing out of massive trunk systems that have
fused and formed flying buttresses, sometimes carved into blackened chambers, hollowed out by fire, called
“fire caves.” Thick layers of soil sitting on limbs harbor animal and plant life that is unknown to science.
Humans move through the deep canopy suspended on ropes, far out of sight of the ground, knowing that the
price of a small mistake can be a plunge to one’s death.

Preston’s account of this amazing world, by turns terrifying, moving, and fascinating, is an adventure story
told in novelistic detail by a master of nonfiction narrative. The author shares his protagonists’ passion for
tall trees, and he mastered the techniques of tall-tree climbing to tell the story in The Wild Trees–the story of
the fate of the world’s most splendid forests and of the imperiled biosphere itself.

From the Hardcover edition.
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From reader reviews:

Curtis Dugan:

The reason why? Because this The Wild Trees: A Story of Passion and Daring is an unordinary book that the
inside of the e-book waiting for you to snap that but latter it will zap you with the secret this inside. Reading
this book beside it was fantastic author who have write the book in such incredible way makes the content on
the inside easier to understand, entertaining method but still convey the meaning thoroughly. So , it is good
for you because of not hesitating having this anymore or you going to regret it. This book will give you a lot
of positive aspects than the other book possess such as help improving your expertise and your critical
thinking approach. So , still want to hold up having that book? If I ended up you I will go to the publication
store hurriedly.

Hazel Reinoso:

This The Wild Trees: A Story of Passion and Daring is brand new way for you who has interest to look for
some information given it relief your hunger info. Getting deeper you onto it getting knowledge more you
know or perhaps you who still having little digest in reading this The Wild Trees: A Story of Passion and
Daring can be the light food for you personally because the information inside this specific book is easy to
get through anyone. These books build itself in the form which can be reachable by anyone, yep I mean in
the e-book contact form. People who think that in book form make them feel drowsy even dizzy this reserve
is the answer. So there is no in reading a guide especially this one. You can find actually looking for. It
should be here for an individual. So , don't miss that! Just read this e-book kind for your better life along
with knowledge.

Moses Bean:

A lot of guide has printed but it differs. You can get it by online on social media. You can choose the top
book for you, science, comedy, novel, or whatever simply by searching from it. It is called of book The Wild
Trees: A Story of Passion and Daring. Contain your knowledge by it. Without causing the printed book, it
might add your knowledge and make a person happier to read. It is most critical that, you must aware about
guide. It can bring you from one spot to other place.

Alice Myers:

What is your hobby? Have you heard which question when you got learners? We believe that that issue was
given by teacher on their students. Many kinds of hobby, Every individual has different hobby. So you know
that little person similar to reading or as reading through become their hobby. You should know that reading
is very important in addition to book as to be the issue. Book is important thing to incorporate you
knowledge, except your own personal teacher or lecturer. You will find good news or update about
something by book. Different categories of books that can you take to be your object. One of them is actually
The Wild Trees: A Story of Passion and Daring.
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