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A multi-tasking mama, Summer Finley has found ways to handle whatever life throws at her with grace and
a grin. Until now, that is. An “abnormal” medical test result sends Summer into an emotional tailspin and
prompts her to fulfill a life-long dream of “meeting” her best friend and pen pal since fourth grade, Noelle
Van Zandt, face-to-face.

Their blissful week together in the Netherlands finds Summer and Noelle floating down a canal in
Amsterdam, visiting Corrie Ten Boom’s Hiding Place, sipping decadent Dutch cocoa in Delft, and bobbing
merrily along through a sea of brilliant, spring-fresh tulips. Each day takes them further from midlife anxiety
and closer to trusting God in deeper ways.

When Summer finally confides in Noelle about the abnormal test results, Summer’s honesty prompts Noelle
to share a long-held heartache. The two friends find they both needed to be together more than either of them
realized. Could it be this adventure was tucked away in God’s imagination long before Summer bought her
ticket to fly to the land of merry tulips and kalomping wooden shoes?

From the Trade Paperback edition.
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From reader reviews:

Eric Campbell:

This Sisterchicks in Wooden Shoes! usually are reliable for you who want to be a successful person, why.
The explanation of this Sisterchicks in Wooden Shoes! can be one of many great books you must have is
definitely giving you more than just simple reading through food but feed an individual with information that
probably will shock your previous knowledge. This book is actually handy, you can bring it all over the
place and whenever your conditions in the e-book and printed ones. Beside that this Sisterchicks in Wooden
Shoes! giving you an enormous of experience such as rich vocabulary, giving you trial of critical thinking
that we understand it useful in your day activity. So , let's have it and revel in reading.

Heidi Odom:

Do you have something that you enjoy such as book? The book lovers usually prefer to decide on book like
comic, limited story and the biggest you are novel. Now, why not striving Sisterchicks in Wooden Shoes!
that give your enjoyment preference will be satisfied by reading this book. Reading habit all over the world
can be said as the means for people to know world a great deal better then how they react towards the world.
It can't be stated constantly that reading practice only for the geeky individual but for all of you who wants to
always be success person. So , for every you who want to start examining as your good habit, you may pick
Sisterchicks in Wooden Shoes! become your current starter.

Carroll Boggess:

This Sisterchicks in Wooden Shoes! is fresh way for you who has fascination to look for some information
mainly because it relief your hunger info. Getting deeper you onto it getting knowledge more you know or
you who still having tiny amount of digest in reading this Sisterchicks in Wooden Shoes! can be the light
food to suit your needs because the information inside this specific book is easy to get through anyone. These
books develop itself in the form which is reachable by anyone, sure I mean in the e-book form. People who
think that in publication form make them feel sleepy even dizzy this e-book is the answer. So there is
absolutely no in reading a guide especially this one. You can find actually looking for. It should be here for
you. So , don't miss that! Just read this e-book type for your better life along with knowledge.

Rose Watkins:

You may get this Sisterchicks in Wooden Shoes! by visit the bookstore or Mall. Simply viewing or
reviewing it could possibly to be your solve problem if you get difficulties for the knowledge. Kinds of this
guide are various. Not only simply by written or printed but can you enjoy this book simply by e-book. In the
modern era similar to now, you just looking from your mobile phone and searching what your problem.
Right now, choose your current ways to get more information about your book. It is most important to
arrange you to ultimately make your knowledge are still upgrade. Let's try to choose right ways for you.
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