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THE SHERIFF'S ONE-NIGHT STAND

When Deputy Sheriff Royce McCall responds to a break-in at his family's cabin, he doesn't expect the
intruder to be beautiful Sophie Conway—in her nightgown! The last time he saw her, she wasn't wearing
much else, although the details of their New Year's Eve encounter are sketchy at best. Then she admits that
not only has she become a killer's target, but she also lied about carrying Royce's baby in order to escape an
arranged marriage. With too many unanswered questions surrounding this woman he barely knows, Royce
still vows to protect Sophie when the bullets start flying. But when the memories of their one-night stand
become clearer, so does the fact that she may not be lying about being pregnant after all….

If you like STANDOFF AT MUSTANG RIDGE then don't miss THE MARSHAL'S HOSTAGE by
USA TODAY bestselling author Delores Fossen, book one of The Marshals of Maverick County series.
Available now, from Harlequin Intrigue.
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From reader reviews:

Michelle Sanders:

Do you one of people who can't read enjoyable if the sentence chained within the straightway, hold on guys
that aren't like that. This Standoff at Mustang Ridge book is readable through you who hate the perfect word
style. You will find the facts here are arrange for enjoyable studying experience without leaving possibly
decrease the knowledge that want to give to you. The writer associated with Standoff at Mustang Ridge
content conveys the thought easily to understand by many individuals. The printed and e-book are not
different in the written content but it just different available as it. So , do you nevertheless thinking Standoff
at Mustang Ridge is not loveable to be your top list reading book?

Melody Grissom:

Nowadays reading books be a little more than want or need but also be a life style. This reading practice give
you lot of advantages. Associate programs you got of course the knowledge even the information inside the
book that will improve your knowledge and information. The info you get based on what kind of book you
read, if you want attract knowledge just go with training books but if you want really feel happy read one
using theme for entertaining including comic or novel. Typically the Standoff at Mustang Ridge is kind of
publication which is giving the reader erratic experience.

Derick Heinz:

Is it a person who having spare time in that case spend it whole day by watching television programs or just
telling lies on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Standoff at Mustang Ridge can be the
solution, oh how comes? The new book you know. You are and so out of date, spending your extra time by
reading in this brand-new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these ebooks have than the others?

William Sam:

That e-book can make you to feel relax. This specific book Standoff at Mustang Ridge was colourful and of
course has pictures on there. As we know that book Standoff at Mustang Ridge has many kinds or genre.
Start from kids until teens. For example Naruto or Investigation company Conan you can read and feel that
you are the character on there. So , not at all of book tend to be make you bored, any it makes you feel
happy, fun and chill out. Try to choose the best book in your case and try to like reading that.
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