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The Okefenokee Swamp, located in southeastern Georgia and northern Florida, is the largest freshwater
wetland in the United States. In this illustrated guide to the fishes of the swamp, Joshua Laerm and B. J.
Freeman provide descriptions and drawings of thirty-six species, ranging from the American eel to the
speckled madtom, chain pickerel, and blackbanded darter. For each fish, the authors include latinate,
common, and variant names and discuss differences from similar species, local habitats as well as
occurrences beyond the Okefenokee, and feeding and mating patterns.

With each entry Laerm and Freeman also relate brief comments and tips borrowed from the folklore of the
swamp and the experience of fishermen and cooks. The guide thus notes the variety of bait--from kernels of
corn to rotten liver--that will hook a catfish; discusses which fishes are more easily taken by gigging; reveals
the sport involved in catching the flavorful American eel; and identifies those fishes, such as the swamp
darter, that are common as aquarium pets.

Providing descriptions, drawings, and scientific and general information, Fishes of the Okefenokee Swamp is
a complete handbook for the angler, naturalist, and scholar.
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From reader reviews:

Melanie Pemberton:

Reading a book to become new life style in this season; every people loves to read a book. When you
examine a book you can get a great deal of benefit. When you read books, you can improve your knowledge,
mainly because book has a lot of information upon it. The information that you will get depend on what sorts
of book that you have read. If you need to get information about your review, you can read education books,
but if you want to entertain yourself read a fiction books, these us novel, comics, in addition to soon. The
Fishes of the Okefenokee Swamp will give you new experience in looking at a book.

Grady Comer:

Is it you who having spare time and then spend it whole day by simply watching television programs or just
lying on the bed? Do you need something new? This Fishes of the Okefenokee Swamp can be the respond to,
oh how comes? A book you know. You are thus out of date, spending your time by reading in this brand new
era is common not a geek activity. So what these publications have than the others?

Sean Lee:

Don't be worry should you be afraid that this book will certainly filled the space in your house, you might
have it in e-book technique, more simple and reachable. That Fishes of the Okefenokee Swamp can give you
a lot of good friends because by you taking a look at this one book you have issue that they don't and make a
person more like an interesting person. This book can be one of one step for you to get success. This
publication offer you information that maybe your friend doesn't recognize, by knowing more than other
make you to be great persons. So , why hesitate? We need to have Fishes of the Okefenokee Swamp.

Marina Tucker:

Do you like reading a reserve? Confuse to looking for your best book? Or your book seemed to be rare? Why
so many query for the book? But just about any people feel that they enjoy for reading. Some people likes
reading, not only science book but novel and Fishes of the Okefenokee Swamp or maybe others sources were
given expertise for you. After you know how the fantastic a book, you feel need to read more and more.
Science guide was created for teacher or perhaps students especially. Those books are helping them to add
their knowledge. In additional case, beside science publication, any other book likes Fishes of the
Okefenokee Swamp to make your spare time a lot more colorful. Many types of book like this one.
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