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This book invites us to consider ways to remain confident in our faith as we understand and appreciate the
discoveries and advances of science. How can Christians integrate, believe, or accept all the teachings of
science, the Bible, and Christian tradition? How can we believe in both the discoveries of science and the
Bible? Are science and religion compatible or incompatible? Does the Christian understanding that God
created the universe exclude the findings and discoveries of science? What is the role of faith in the world of
education? What can we believe about intelligent design? If we believe in evolution, can we believe in God?
Does the Big Bang theory exclude God? If we are Christians, can we support stem-cell research and cloning?
Can science help us understand the afterlife? Does science negate or support prayer? What is the difference
between faith and reason? Do they exclude or complement one another? As Paul Stroble addresses these
questions and others, he helps us examine different possible ways that religion and science relate to each
other and ways that science and religion provide meaning and value in our lives.

 

PAUL STROBLE is an elder of the Illinois Great Rivers Conference of The United Methodist Church. He
has served both as parish pastor and college instructor and currently teaches at the University of Akron,
where he earned an Excellence in Teaching award. He is a long-time writer-researcher for the United
Methodist curriculum FaithLink and author of numerous articles and curricular materials. Among his eleven
books are Paul and the Galatians and What Do Other Faiths Believe? He is married to Dr. Beth Stroble, and
they have a daughter, Emily.

The FaithQuestions study series is designed to meet the needs of people who have questions about the
Christian faith and who desire a deeper engagement with scripture and with discipleship as they explore
studies of issues in theology, ethics, missions, Bible interpretation, and church history. It seeks to equip a
new generation of church leaders to appreciate the eternal message of the gospel and to develop the skills to
articulate its relevance in our contemporary context. The series would be a good choice for users who have
completed Disciple.
this will be the ninth study in the series, following What About the Rapture -
What Do Other Faiths Believe - What Happens When We Die -
What About Divine Healing - What About the Trinity - What About Forgiveness
- What About the Devil - What About Reading the Bible
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From reader reviews:

Leopoldo Gonzalez:

The book FaithQuestions - What About Religion and Science?: A Study of Reason and Faith give you a
sense of feeling enjoy for your spare time. You may use to make your capable considerably more increase.
Book can being your best friend when you getting tension or having big problem using your subject. If you
can make reading a book FaithQuestions - What About Religion and Science?: A Study of Reason and Faith
for being your habit, you can get far more advantages, like add your own capable, increase your knowledge
about many or all subjects. It is possible to know everything if you like start and read a book FaithQuestions
- What About Religion and Science?: A Study of Reason and Faith. Kinds of book are several. It means that,
science reserve or encyclopedia or other individuals. So , how do you think about this book?

David Hedges:

What do you ponder on book? It is just for students as they are still students or it for all people in the world,
what best subject for that? Just simply you can be answered for that question above. Every person has
various personality and hobby for every single other. Don't to be pushed someone or something that they
don't wish do that. You must know how great in addition to important the book FaithQuestions - What About
Religion and Science?: A Study of Reason and Faith. All type of book are you able to see on many solutions.
You can look for the internet resources or other social media.

Laurence Asher:

With this era which is the greater particular person or who has ability to do something more are more special
than other. Do you want to become one of it? It is just simple method to have that. What you must do is just
spending your time not very much but quite enough to experience a look at some books. One of many books
in the top list in your reading list is FaithQuestions - What About Religion and Science?: A Study of Reason
and Faith. This book which is qualified as The Hungry Hillsides can get you closer in turning out to be
precious person. By looking up and review this publication you can get many advantages.

Eric Kyler:

That book can make you to feel relax. This kind of book FaithQuestions - What About Religion and
Science?: A Study of Reason and Faith was bright colored and of course has pictures on the website. As we
know that book FaithQuestions - What About Religion and Science?: A Study of Reason and Faith has many
kinds or variety. Start from kids until adolescents. For example Naruto or Private eye Conan you can read
and think that you are the character on there. Therefore not at all of book tend to be make you bored, any it
makes you feel happy, fun and relax. Try to choose the best book for you personally and try to like reading
which.
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