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We all know that the rules by which business is conducted have changed. But by how much? The
dot.commers who threw out the playbook and tried to reinvent everything crashed and burned. Back-to-
basics and execution are refrains reverberating down corporate hallways. And yet there is still a sense of
unease. Jonas Ridderstróale and Kjell Nordstróm, the outspoken authors of the international bestseller, Funky
Business, present a provocative analysis of the social and cultural forces that are defining the business
landscape?in particular, the fundamental relationships between employers and employees and between
companies and customers.

Covering a huge terrain?from the impact of high tech to the ever-widening gaps between the haves and the
have-nots, and with references from Adam Smith to Janis Joplin?the authors bring into focus the challenges
of business leadership in a world increasingly defined by individualism. Karaoke capitalism refers to the
philosophy of imitation, engrained into the corporate mindset by such popular concepts as benchmarking and
best practice. For Ridderstróale and Nordstróm, the only way to survive is to chuck convention, to embrace
your company's individual personality and promote it through everything you do, constantly honing what
works and abandoning what doesn't. Ultimately, the authors argue that armed with imagination it is possible
to sustain profitable businesses while contributing to the well-being of customers, communities, and the
society at large. Visit the authors' Web sites at www.karaokecapitalism.com and www.funkybusiness.com.
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From reader reviews:

Carol Castaneda:

The actual book Karaoke Capitalism: Daring to Be Different in a Copycat World has a lot associated with on
it. So when you make sure to read this book you can get a lot of gain. The book was compiled by the very
famous author. The author makes some research previous to write this book. This kind of book very easy to
read you may get the point easily after reading this article book.

Anita Winn:

Playing with family in a very park, coming to see the ocean world or hanging out with buddies is thing that
usually you have done when you have spare time, then why you don't try thing that really opposite from that.
A single activity that make you not experience tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you are
ride on and with addition of knowledge. Even you love Karaoke Capitalism: Daring to Be Different in a
Copycat World, you are able to enjoy both. It is fine combination right, you still want to miss it? What kind
of hang type is it? Oh seriously its mind hangout men. What? Still don't get it, oh come on its called reading
friends.

Keith Devine:

This Karaoke Capitalism: Daring to Be Different in a Copycat World is great reserve for you because the
content that is full of information for you who else always deal with world and still have to make decision
every minute. This particular book reveal it facts accurately using great plan word or we can point out no
rambling sentences within it. So if you are read this hurriedly you can have whole data in it. Doesn't mean it
only provides you with straight forward sentences but tricky core information with beautiful delivering
sentences. Having Karaoke Capitalism: Daring to Be Different in a Copycat World in your hand like finding
the world in your arm, details in it is not ridiculous a single. We can say that no e-book that offer you world
within ten or fifteen minute right but this book already do that. So , this is certainly good reading book. Heya
Mr. and Mrs. occupied do you still doubt in which?

Jonathan Smith:

As a pupil exactly feel bored for you to reading. If their teacher questioned them to go to the library as well
as to make summary for some guide, they are complained. Just tiny students that has reading's heart or real
their hobby. They just do what the trainer want, like asked to the library. They go to generally there but
nothing reading very seriously. Any students feel that reading through is not important, boring in addition to
can't see colorful pics on there. Yeah, it is to get complicated. Book is very important for you. As we know
that on this age, many ways to get whatever we would like. Likewise word says, many ways to reach
Chinese's country. Therefore this Karaoke Capitalism: Daring to Be Different in a Copycat World can make
you really feel more interested to read.
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