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In 1960, Cuban photographer Alberto Korda captured fabled revolutionary Ernesto “Che” Guevara in what
has become history's most reproduced photo. Now Michael Casey tells the remarkable story of this image,
detailing its evolution from a casual snapshot to an omnipresent graphic—plastered on everything from T-
shirts to vodka to condoms—and into a copyrighted brand. As Casey follows it across the Americas and
through cyberspace, he finds governments exploiting it and their dissenters attacking it, merchants selling it
and tourists buying it. We see how this image is, ultimately, a mercurial icon that still ignites passion—and a
reflection of how we view ourselves.

From the Trade Paperback edition.
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From reader reviews:

Avis Zeiger:

In this 21st one hundred year, people become competitive in every single way. By being competitive now,
people have do something to make these people survives, being in the middle of the actual crowded place
and notice by simply surrounding. One thing that at times many people have underestimated this for a while
is reading. Yep, by reading a reserve your ability to survive improve then having chance to stand up than
other is high. In your case who want to start reading some sort of book, we give you this particular Che's
Afterlife: The Legacy of an Image book as nice and daily reading e-book. Why, because this book is more
than just a book.

Margaret Holt:

The experience that you get from Che's Afterlife: The Legacy of an Image is a more deep you rooting the
information that hide within the words the more you get thinking about reading it. It doesn't mean that this
book is hard to know but Che's Afterlife: The Legacy of an Image giving you thrill feeling of reading. The
article writer conveys their point in particular way that can be understood simply by anyone who read this
because the author of this publication is well-known enough. This kind of book also makes your own
vocabulary increase well. Making it easy to understand then can go along, both in printed or e-book style are
available. We recommend you for having this Che's Afterlife: The Legacy of an Image instantly.

Frederica Dawkins:

This book untitled Che's Afterlife: The Legacy of an Image to be one of several books that best seller in this
year, this is because when you read this reserve you can get a lot of benefit onto it. You will easily to buy
this kind of book in the book retail store or you can order it through online. The publisher on this book sells
the e-book too. It makes you quicker to read this book, since you can read this book in your Smartphone. So
there is no reason for you to past this publication from your list.

Bruce Davis:

Do you have something that you like such as book? The book lovers usually prefer to choose book like
comic, small story and the biggest one is novel. Now, why not attempting Che's Afterlife: The Legacy of an
Image that give your fun preference will be satisfied simply by reading this book. Reading practice all over
the world can be said as the opportunity for people to know world far better then how they react when it
comes to the world. It can't be said constantly that reading behavior only for the geeky individual but for all
of you who wants to be success person. So , for all you who want to start studying as your good habit, it is
possible to pick Che's Afterlife: The Legacy of an Image become your current starter.
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